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ABARE has been a consortium member of GTAP since its inception. The 
MEGABARE model, the predecessor of the Global Trade and 
Environment Model (GTEM) of ABARE, was an enhancement of the 
first version of the GTAP model. The GTAP database is the major input 
into the GTEM database, which also requires an elaborate population 
database, energy volume database, technology bundle database and an 
emissions database.  
 
Currently, ABARE is updating the GTEM database using GTAP v7.1. 
  
ABARE has noticed that international transport cost per unit of exports at 
fob prices of a commodity from a source country may not have been 
correctly aligned with the relative distances to the destination countries. 
We advise that this issue be reviewed by experts in the GTAP Centre and 
addressed, if found correct. This part of the database is emerging as very 
policy relevant internationally. 
 
ABARE is now considering using the emissions database produced by 
the GTAP team and would encourage its inclusion into the core database 
development program. 
 
Recently, ABARE has developed a land use change and forestry module 
for GTEM and implemented it with a stylised database. A paper 
describing the module, its implementation and the results will be 
presented to the 13th Annual Conference on Global Economic Analysis, 
on Thursday, 10 June 2010. Based on the experience gained from this 
exercise, ABARE proposes that the forestry sector in the GTAP database 
be split into two sectors forest– planting and forest harvesting. Similarly, 
the capital goods sector be split into at least two sectors – physical capital 
goods sector and forestry investment sector. ABARE is more than happy 
to share the details of the steps taken in developing the stylised database.  
 



ABARE has been working in the development of an integrated 
assessment model of global climate change. Currently we are developing 
the second generation of the Global Integrated Assessment Model 
(GIAM) in collaboration with the Commonwealth Scientific and 
Industrial Research Organisation (CSIRO). 
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